
 

MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY 

Olga: 07.00 Clean the coffee 
machine and the shelf in the 
entrance of the pre-school, fill 
it upp with water/,make sure 
there is sugar and cups 
available/ Fixa laundry room 
 
Magda : 13.00 Freshen 
upstairs toilets and through 
away all papper towels and 
toilet papper and diapers 
 
Darren: 12.00 Freshen up 
diaper room downstairs and 
through away all diapers 
 
Savita 13.00 Freshen up 
downstairs toilets and through 
away all papper towels and 
toilet papper  
 
Hebert & Precious 17.00 
Collect all outside toys and put 
them in the box and 
tricycles/sliders inside the 
fence  
 
Poh Ling  15.50 – Feed the 
fishes / organize  water  room 
 
 

Savita 07.00 Clean the coffee 
machine and the shelf in the 
entrance of the pre-school, fill 
it upp with water/,make sure 
there is sugar and cups 
available/ Fixa laundry room 
 
Adelina: 13.00 Freshen 
upstairs toilets and through 
away all papper towels and 
toilet papper and diapers 
 
Rajni: 12.00 Freshen up 
diaper room downstair and 
through away all diapers 
 
Corrie 13.00 Freshen up 
downstairs toilets and through 
away all papper towels and 
toilet papper  
 
Rajni & Precious 17.00 
Collect all outside toys and put 
them in the box and tricycles 
inside the fence  
 
Poh Ling  15.50 – Feed the 
fishes and organize  water 
room-  
 
 

Olga: 07.00 Clean the coffee 
machine and the shelf in the 
entrance of the pre-school, fill 
it upp with water/,make sure 
there is sugar and cups 
available/ Fixa laundry room  
 
Jing Han : 13.00 Freshen 
upstairs toilets and through 
away all papper towels and 
toilet papper and diapers 
 
Nermeen: 12.00 Freshen up 
diaper room downstair and 
through away all diapers 
 
Corrie  13.00 Freshen up 
downstairs toilets and through 
away all papper towels and 
toilet papper  
 
Florentine& Ritu 17.00 
Collect all outside toys and put 
them in the box and 
tricycles/sliders inside the 
fence  
 
Poh Ling  15.50 – Feed the 
fishes and organize  water 
room-  
 

poh Ling: 07.00 Clean the 
coffee machine and the shelf in 
the entrance of the pre-school, 
fill it upp with water/,Pmake 
sure there is sugar and cups 
available/ Fixa laundry room  
 
Savita: 13.00 Freshen upstairs 
toilets and through away all 
papper towels and toilet 
papper and diapers 
 
Ritu: 12.00 Freshen up diaper 
room downstair and through 
away all diapers 
 
Florentine 13.00 Freshen up 
downstairs toilets and through 
away all papper towels and 
toilet papper  
 
Corrie &Olga 17.00  Collect all 
outside toys and put them in 
the box and tricycles/sliders 
inside the fence  
 
Hebert  15.50 – Feed the fish 
/organize  water room-  
 
Darren – 16.00 Clean/ 
Organize Science room- Plants 

Rajni : 07.00 Clean the coffee 
machine and the shelf in the 
entrance of the pre-school, fill 
it upp with water/,make sure 
there is sugar and cups 
available/ Fixa laundry room 
 
Asma: 13.00 Freshen upstairs 
toilets and through away all 
papper towels and toilet 
papper and diapers 
 
Jing: 12.00 Freshen up diaper 
room downstairs and throw 
away all diapers 
 
Olga 13.00 Freshen up 
downstairs toilets and through 
away all paper towels and 
toilet paper  
 
Florentine&Corrie 17.00 
Collect all outside toys and put 
them in the box and 
tricycles/sliders inside the 
fence  
Poh Ling  15.50 – Feed the 
fish and organize  water ro 
om-  
 
 



Rajni – 16.15 Clean/ Organize 
Science room – water Plants 
 
Elena – 15.30 Clean/ Organize 
Pretend room/Drama room 
 
Asma – 13.30 Clean/ Organize 
Art Room/Gym 
 
Adelina- 13.00– Clean/ 
Organize Math/ construction 
room 
 
Therese  17.30– Clean/ 
Organize Cloak room upstairs 
and liftt up all shoes 
 
Nermeen 13.30 
Clean/Organize Cloak room 
downstairs and lyft up  shoes 
 
Meriy 13.30 Fix and organize 
board games room(make sure 
all games are in the right box 
 
Asma  -Collect and organize all 
the stuff that are on the shelves 
upstairs and downstairs 
 
Ritu 13.30 Fix and organize 
Library & 5 senses room 

Asma –16.20 Organize science 
room- water plants 
 
Magda 14.00 – Clean/ 
Organize Pretend room/Drama 
room 
 
Olga– 13.30 Clean/ Organize 
Art Room/ Gym 
 
Ritu–16.00 Clean/ Organize 
Math/ construction room 
 
Hebert 15.45– Clean/ 
Organize Cloak room upstairs 
and lyft up all shoes 
 
Darren 16.15  Clean/Organize 
Cloak room downstairs and lyft 
up all shoes 
 
Nermeen 14.45 Fix and 
organize board games room 
 
Jing Han  -Collect and organize 
all the stuff that are on the 
shelves upstairs and 
downstairs 
 
Elena 15.45 Fix and organize 
Library & 5 senses room 
 

Savita– 16.20 Clean/ Organize 
Science room – 
 
Therese– Clean/ Organize 
Pretend room/Drama room 
 
Hebert– 14.45 Clean/ 
Organize  Art Room/Gym 
 
Rajni– 14.00 Clean/ Organize 
Math/ construction room 
 
Asma 15.15– Clean/ Organize 
Cloak room uppstairs and lyft 
up all shoes 
 
Meriy 15.30– Clean/ Organize 
Cloak room downstairs and lyft 
up all shoes 
 
Elena 15.00 Fix and organize 
board games room 
 
Darren  -Collect and organize 
all the stuff that are on the 
shelves upstairs and 
downstairs 
 
Adelina 13.00 Fix and 
organize Library & 5 senses 
room 

Magda– Clean/ Organize 
Pretend room/Drama room 
 
Asma– 15.50 Clean/ Organize 
Art Room/ Gym 
 
Elena–15.00 Clean/ Organize 
Math/ construction room 
 
Precious 16.50– Clean/ 
Organize Cloak room upstairs 
and lyft up all shoes 
 
Rajni 15.50– Clean/ Organize 
Cloak room downstairs and lyft 
up all shoes 
 
Adelina 13.00 Fix and 
organize board games room 
 
Therese – 16.40  Collect all 
outside toys and put them in 
the box and tricycles inside the 
fence(together with Corrie 
 
Hebert -17.00Collect and 
organize all the stuff that are 
on the shelves upstairs and 
downstairs 
 
Nermeen  15.10 Fix and 
organize Library & 5 senses 
room 
 

Elena – 16.20 Clean/ Organize 
Science room 
 
Magda –  Clean/ Organize 
pretend /drama room 
 
Ritu– 15.00 Clean/ Organize 
Art Room/ Gym 
 
Hebert– Clean/ Organize 
Math/ construction room 
 
Darren 15.50– Clean/ 
Organize Cloak room upstairs 
and lyft up all shoes 
 
Precious 15.50– Clean/ 
Organize Cloak room 
downstairs and lyft up all 
shoes 
 
Nermeen 15.30 Fix and 
organize board games room 
 
Therese 15.00-Collect and 
organize all the stuff that are 
on the shelves upstairs and 
downstairs 
Savita 15.40 Fix and organize 
Library & 
 5 senses room  
 



 


